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Director of Compliance and Innovation Report 
 

April 19, 2023 
 
Plant Loading, CSO Report, and Director’s Notes   
 
Plant Influent Report 
 
Biochemical Oxygen Demand, 5-Day (Avg. 35082 lbs/day)    55 percent of design 
Total Suspended Solids (Avg. 61650 lbs/day)      57 percent of design 
Average Daily Flow (40.84 million gallons/day)      100 percent of design 
Maximum Daily Flow (85.57 million gallons/day)      68 percent of design 
 
Plant Effluent Report 
 

Parameter Report Frequency Permit 
Limits  

 

Reported 
Values 

Violations 

CBOD5, mg/L Mo./Wk. Avg 20/40  2/3 0 
TSS, mg/L Mo./Wk. Avg 25/45 5/7 0 

NH3-N, mg/L Mo. Avg/Daily Max 1.5/3.0 0.12/0.12 0 
DO, mg/L Mo. Avg/Wk. Avg/Daily Min 6.0/6.25/5.0 8.41/8.31/8.15 0 
pH, S.U. Daily Min/Max 6.0/9.0 7.81/8.20 0 

Total Nickel, mg/L Mo. Avg 0.0381 0.019 0 
CL2 Residual, mg/L Daily Max 0.05 NA 0 

Fecal Coliform 
CFU/100mL 

Daily Max 400 NA 0 

  
 
CSO Report 
 

 
Location 

 
Events 

Est. Total Duration 
of Discharges (hrs.) 

Discharge (million 
gallons) 

Oakland Avenue 
(Outfall 003) 3 21.19 10.28 

Lincoln Park 
(Outfall 004) 0 0 0 

McKinley Avenue 
(Outfall 007) 2 10.7 6.74 

Seventh Ward 
(Outfall 008) 1 1.1 7.45 

 
 
Director’s Notes: 
 
2023 Chemical Bids: 
A request for bids for chemicals and fuels that are used at the Sanitary District was posted in the 
newspaper and the District’s website on February 8, 2023. All bids were opened and read on April 5, 
2023. 
 
The purchase period offered on all chemicals this year was for one year only, therefore the period 
included with the bid sheet covers the period May 1, 2023 – April 30, 2024. The one-year submission 
reflects the unstable conditions in the chemical market still occurring, but some bids returned this 
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year were much better then the pervious. Evergreen FS did offer a bid for the three-year period 
covering the period of May 1, 2023- April 30, 2026 but since they are the only bid we are only 
recommending accep.  
 
A motion for the acceptance of the following bids will be presented to the Boards during this month’s 
Board meeting.  
 
A summary of the low bids and pervious year accepted bids will be distributed before the meeting. 
 
Staff Training Activities: 
Brandi Rosenberger and Raven Durbin have passed the EPA Class III certification test. Raven has 
the required amount of training and experience and is waiting for the State to finalize her certification. 
Brandi has submitted her training and experience to the State and is waiting for a determination of 
how much additional time or training is required. Chuck Roberts has successfully passed the Class 
IIII exam and will be waiting for certification of his training and experience also.  
 
Keith Richards, Tim Gordon, Brent Deardorff, Austin Gruber, and Ashley Bailey attended the Illinois 
Association of Water Pollution Control Operations (IWAPCO) conference for Illinois wastewater 
professionals in Springfield from April 10-12, 2023. The conference included presentations on case 
studies, emerging issues of concern, wastewater technologies, and a variety of other topics.  
 
Operations, Laboratory, and Pretreatment Activity Reports – March/April 2023 
 
Operations Activities:    
Normal operational activities were conducted as prescribed by standard procedures or in response 
to conditions within the plant. These include operating, monitoring, and adjusting facility equipment, 
performing process control testing, records keeping, and coordination with the other departments to 
realize optimal performance of the Plant. 

 
1) Digester gas production has returned to normal production. 

 
2) The mixer in digester #1 has been taken off-line due to a bad seal. The mixers in digesters #2 

and #4 are available but currently off due to gas in the attic spaces.   
 

3) Operators have been assisting Engineering with the filling and draining of #3 Digester and #5 
Primary Clarifier, gearing up for disinfection season, training newer operators, and assisting 
Maintenance with cleaning the Contact tanks 

 
4) Blower usage is back to normal (2 neuros on at all times with the 3rd starting when needed). 

 
5) Operations staff continue to actively address PMs as time, workload, and staff levels allow.   

 
Laboratory Activities: 
Routine: 
 
A total of 2,066 analyses were performed in the laboratory during the month of March 2023. 
 
Monitoring of treatment plant, industrial users, and receiving stream samples for compliance 
purposes and process monitoring continued. Laboratory personnel continued to perform additional 
background nutrient monitoring to help fully characterize the nutrient loading on the plant. 

 
Non-Routine: 

1) The SDD lab continued to send samples of raw influent twice a week throughout the month of 
March 2023 for the “COVID-19 in Wastewater” study funded by the Illinois Department of Public 
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Health. A Zoom call was held on March 3, 2023, with the study participants and the researchers 
to discuss the results of the study thus far. It was announced that they plan to start analyzing 
for Respiratory Syncytial Virus (RSV) A and B in the samples in addition to COVID and influenza. 

2) Keith Richard and Ashley Bailey attended a meeting of pretreatment professionals from various 
central Illinois sanitary districts on March 8, 2023, in Normal. The group plans to meet routinely 
to network and help each other with any pretreatment related questions or issues. 

3) The SDD lab/pretreatment collected and analyzed two more days of samples for the ongoing 
nutrient study for Black and Veatch. Samples were collected on March 15 and March 30, 2023. 

4) The fourth round of biomonitoring, as required by our NPDES discharge permit, was completed 
in March 2023 using a sample of the SDD effluent collected on March 13, 2023. Just as in the 
previous three rounds of biomonitoring, there was no acute toxicity found in the SDD effluent. 
We have now completed all of the biomonitoring that was required by our current NPDES permit. 

5) Keith Richard, Ashley Bailey, and Tim Gorden virtually attended the Innovations at the Nexus of 
Food, Energy and Water Systems (INFEWS) workshop on March 23-24, 2023. INFEWS is a project 
funded by the National Science Foundation and the USDA. A group of researchers at the University 
of Illinois Urbana Champaign received an INFEWS grant to study the Lake Decatur watershed 
including the SDD, ADM, and Primient. The purpose of the workshop was to give updates on the 
various parts of the research study. Several workshop attendees came for a tour of the SDD on 
March 24. 

 
Pretreatment Activities: 
Pretreatment - General Activities: 

1) Pretreatment personnel monitored eleven commercial and industrial users (IU) during March 
2023. No industrial site inspections were conducted. 

2) Bimonthly sampling for the Nutrient Study is ongoing. SDD personnel are utilizing our portable 
samplers to collect the extra samples from Primient and ADM. 

3) Wastewater Hauler Permit applications were granted for Alpha Drains and Smith Septic.  

Pretreatment Ordinance - Verbal Notices: 

The SDD issued a total of 3 Verbal Notices to Primient in March 2023: 

1. Notice 1 was issued on 3/3/2023 for a BOD limit violation and carried a $1,000 penalty. 
2. Notice 2 was issued on 3/13/2023 for a pH violation resulting from a cooling tower chemical 

leak. This notice carried a $1,000 penalty. 
3. Notice 3 was issued on 3/14/2023 for a pH violation resulting from a cooling tower chemical 

leak. As it was Primient’s third violation of the month, this notice carried a penalty of 
$7,500. 

Pretreatment Ordinance - Warning Notices (WN): 
No Warning Notices were issued during February 2023.   

Pretreatment Ordinance - Notices of Violation (NOV): 
No Notices of Violation were issued during February 2023.  

Pretreatment Ordinance - Executive Orders: 
No Executive Orders were issued during March 2023 

Pretreatment Ordinance - Penalty Assessments: 
The following industrial penalties were assessed for March 2023: 

1) Primient       $9,500 
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Plant Operating Graphs: 
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Phosphorus Tracking Graph: 
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Plant Efficiency Graphs: 

March 2023 
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Sanitary District of Decatur 
Bid Tabulation Results from 

04/05/2023 
(Pending Approval) 

 
Attached (see below) are the bid tabulations from 04/05/23, please 

note that no submitted bids are accepted until the District’s Board of 
Trustees have voted to approve them. These are just the results of the 
bids opened that day. Please feel free to check the District’s website 

for additional information. www.sddcleanwater.org 



28% Liquid Urea-Ammonium Nitrate (UAN) Bid Tabulation 
 

Bid Opening Date _______04/05/23______________________ 
 
 

Bidder Price per 
ton, Base 

 
Brandt 
 

 
$317/ton-

1 year 
 
Wilson Chemicals 

 
$395/ton- 

1 year 
 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
NOTE: “No Bid” submissions are not included on this 
tabulation sheet. 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 



2023 Liquid Ferrous Chloride Bid Tabulation 
 

Bid Opening Date ____04/05/23_______________________ 
 
 

Bidder Price per 
pound 

 
PVS Technologies                             
 
 

 
$1.65/lb- 

1 year 
 

 
Kemira  
 

 
$0.876/lb- 

1 year 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

NOTE: “No Bid” submissions are not included in the bid 
tabulation sheet. 
 

 

 
 



2023 Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Bid Tabulation  
 

Bid Opening Date ____4/5/23________________________ 
 
 

Bidder Gasoline and 
Diesel Fuel 

Cost per 
Gallon above 
OPIS Rack 

Year 

 
Evergreen 
 

$ 0.214 
$ 0.224 
$ 0.234 

1 
2 
3 
 

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 



2023 Sodium Hypochlorite Bid Tabulation 
 

Bid Opening Date _______04/05/23______________________ 
 
 

Bidder Price per 
Gallon 

 
Rowell Chemical 

 
2.58/gal-     

1 year 

 
Brenntag Mid South 

2.59/gal-     
1 year 

4,500g min 
 
Hawkins 

 
1.63/gal-     

1 year 
 
Alexander Chemical 

 
2.45/gal-     

1 year 
  

 
 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 
 

 

  

NOTE: “No Bid” submissions are not listed on this 
tabulation sheet. 
 

 

 
 

 

 



2023 Sodium Bisulfite Bid Tabulation 
 

Bid Opening Date ______04/05/23____________________ 
 
 

Bidder Price per 100lbs 
Bulk 

Price per 325gal tote 
 

 
Alexander Chemical 

$23.90 
$0.239/lb 

$0.349/lb- 
1 year delivery 

included 
 
Brenntag Mid South 

 
-No bid- 

$6.14/gal, $0.55/lb, 
305 gallon tote= 
$1870 delivery 

included 
 
Southern Ionics 

 
$25.00 

 
-No Bid- 

   

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

NOTE: “No Bid” submissions are not 
included in the tabulation sheet. 

  

   

 



 

Black & Veatch 

12400 Olive Blvd, Suite 507, Creve Coeur, MO 63141 USA

P +1 636 536 5878 E GrossenheiderD@BV.com

 

 

April 3, 2023 

 

Sanitary District of Decatur (SDD) Nutrient Program Manager 

501 Dipper Lane BV Project No. 411502 

Decatur, IL 62522  

  

 

Attention: Don Miller, P.E., Director of Engineering 

 

Subject: SDD Nutrient Program Management 

 February Monthly Progress Update (March 1, 2023 – March 31, 2023) 

 

Dear Mr. Miller:  

 

This letter summarizes the work associated to the SDD Nutrient Program Management project for 

services from March 1, 2023, through March 31, 2023.  

 

1. Program Management, Administration, and Coordination 

• Conducted bi-weekly program conference calls to update progress and discuss key 

issues. 

• Provided Monthly Project Update. 

• Provided ongoing management of the project including program management, 

preparation/monitoring of the program schedule and budget as well as program 

administrative duties. 

• Continued to coordinate Power BI development including project data integration and 

dashboard development.  

i. BV received data from SDD Historian software and modified the data set to 

reconcile duplicate data.  

ii. BV prepared for and completed an initial review of the Power BI dashboards 

incorporating data provided by SDD.  

iii. BV began to complete the Power BI dashboards as outlined in the initial meeting 

ahead of a follow up workshop.  

2. Pretreatment Program Update 

• Continued to evaluate special sampling data 

• Continued to work with Jacobs and coordinate their review of pre-treatment programs 

for municipalities with similar influent as SDD due to industrial users.  

• Prepared for and met with SDD to provide summary of current pretreatment and special 

monitoring data and to present options for structuring the industrial pretreatment 

program.  

 

3. Phosphorus Discharge and Optimization Plan (PDOP) 

• Completed the final report for IEPA submittal.  

• Completed annual PDOP summary report. 
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