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The District wishes to thank everyone for their bids.  

A copy of this document is also available on the District’s Website at www.sddcleanwater.org  

 

http://www.sddcleanwater.org/


2024 Liquid Ferrous Chloride Bid Tabulation 
 

Bid Opening Date ____04/03/24_______________________ 
 
 

Bidder Price per 
pound 

 
Brenntag Mid South 

 
-No Bid- 

 
 
Kemira 

Year 1- $0.948 
Year 2- $0.995 
Year 3- $1.055 

 
PVS Technologies 
 
 

Year 1- $0.87 
Year 2- $1.20 
Year 3- $1.50 

 
Pencco 
 
 

 
-No Bid- 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

NOTE: “No Bid” submissions are not included in the bid 
tabulation sheet. 
 

 

 
 



2024 Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Bid Tabulation  
 

Bid Opening Date ____04/03/24________________________ 
 
 

Bidder Gasoline and 
Diesel Fuel 

Cost per 
Gallon above 
OPIS Rack 

Year 

 
Brenntag Mid South 

 
-No Bid- 

 

 
Evergreen FS 
 
 

$0.224 
$0.234 
$0.245 

1 
2 
3 

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 

  

 
 
 
 



2024 Sodium Bisulfite Bid Tabulation 
 

Bid Opening Date ______04/03/24____________________ 
 
 

Bidder Price per 100lbs 
Bulk 

Price per 325gal tote 
 

 
Brenntag Mid South 

$16.67 
*5 business day 

305 gallon tote @ 
$1,111.80 * 5 
business day 

 
PVS Chemical Solutions 

Year 1- $16.94 
Year 2- $20.24 
Year 3- $23.24 

 

 
Catalynt Solutions  

 
$24.50 

 

 
Alexander Chemical 

Year 1- $27.50 
Year 2- $29.70 
Year 3- $32.70 

 
$0.499/lb  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

NOTE: “No Bid” submissions are not 
included in the tabulation sheet. 

  

   

 



2024 Sodium Hypochlorite Bid Tabulation 
 

Bid Opening Date _______04/03/24_____________________ 
 
 

Bidder Price per 
Gallon 

 
Brenntag Mid South 

Year1- $1.97 
Year 2- No Bid- 
Year 3- No Bid- 

 
Rowell Chemical 

Year1- $2.00 
Year 2- $2.10 

Year 3- $2.20 
 
Alexander Chemical 
 

 
$2.299 

 
Hawkins 

Year1- $1.90 
Year 2- No Bid- 
Year 3- No Bid- 

  

 
 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 
 

 

 
 
 

 

  

NOTE: “No Bid” submissions are not listed on this 
tabulation sheet. 
 

 

 
 

 

 



28% Liquid Urea-Ammonium Nitrate (UAN) Bid Tabulation 
 

Bid Opening Date _______04/03/24______________________ 
 
 

Bidder Price per 
ton, Base 

 
Brenntag Mid South 
 

 
-No Bid- 

 
Brandt 

 
Year 1- 

$354/ton 
 
Wilson Chemical Solutions * 
 
 

 
Year 1- 

$380/ton 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
NOTE: “No Bid” submissions are not included on this 
tabulation sheet. 
 
 

 

 
*Delivered to wrong address opened on 4/5/24 @8:21am AB 
 
 

 

 
 



2024 W.A.S. Flocculant (Polymer) Bid Tabulation 
 

Bid Opening Date ______04/03/24____________________ 
 
 

Bidder Price per 100lbs 
Bulk 

Price per 325gal tote 
 

 
Brenntag Mid South 

 
-No Bid- 

 

 
SNF-Polydyne 

Year 1- $1.36/lb 
Year 2- $1.40/lb 
Year 3- $1.44/lb 

 

   

   

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

 
 
 

  

NOTE: “No Bid” submissions are not 
included in the tabulation sheet. 
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